





STEGEMAN, MARY LOUISE (D/C)	0.43	2017	\$ 10.48	\$ -	\$ 13.95	\$ -	\$ 24.43	
SITE ADDRESS: OLD STAGE RD		2016	\$ 8.86	\$ -	\$ 4.62	\$ -	\$ 13.48	
0608340002001003.001		2015	\$ 8.84	\$ -	\$ 6.63	\$ 237.36	\$ 252.83	
ALL THAT PART OF LOT NO. 3 OF RABBIT RUN ACRES PLAT 2, PER PLAT OF RECORD IN PLAT BOOK 11, PAGE 346, COLE COUNTY RECORDERS OFFICE, THAT LIES IN THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF SEC: 27 TWP: 45 N RNG: 13W					TOTAL	\$	290.74	NO BID
TAYLOR, JUANITA C/O H REYNOLDS	0.29	2017	\$ 386.22	\$ -	\$ 113.29	\$ -	\$ 499.51	
SITE ADDRESS: 612 CHESTNUT ST		2016	\$ 328.99	\$ -	\$ 152.08	\$ -	\$ 481.07	
1104170002007020		2015	\$ 328.77	\$ -	\$ 216.75	\$ 237.36	\$ 782.88	
CITY OF JEFFERSON INLOT PT INLOT 874; N 118.75' OF INLOT 874 SEC: 17 TWP: 44 RNG: 11					TOTAL	\$	1,763.46	\$ 4,400.00 \$ 54.00 \$ 4,454.00
VIETH, CAROL SUE - SONIUS, PAMELA KAY 2ND OFFERING	0.12	2017	\$ 10.97	\$ -	\$ 14.08	\$ -	\$ 25.05	
SITE ADDRESS: SHAWN DR		2016	\$ 9.35	\$ -	\$ 4.85	\$ -	\$ 14.20	
0508340002006023.001		2015	\$ 9.33	\$ -	\$ 6.94	\$ 237.36	\$ 253.63	
WESTWOODRIDGE SEC 6 N PT LOT 128 SEC: 34 TWP: 45 RNG: 12		2014	\$ 9.38	\$ -	\$ 9.10	\$ 218.00	\$ 236.48	
					TOTAL	\$	529.36	NO BID
WILLIAMS, SYLVESTER	0.18	2017	\$ 76.78	\$ 24,969.27	\$ 6,633.35	\$ -	\$ 31,679.40	
SITE ADDRESS: 311 CHERRY ST		2016	\$ 65.40	\$ 4,459.18	\$ 2,084.57	\$ -	\$ 6,609.15	
1103080003014010		2015	\$ 412.82	\$ 1,018.14	\$ 940.67	\$ 237.36	\$ 2,608.99	
CITY OF JEFFERSON INLOT N 78.75' OF INLOT 524 SEC: 8 TWP: 44 RNG: 11					TOTAL	\$	40,897.54	NO BID
WILSON, JOSEPH R	0.11	2017	\$ 76.78	\$ -	\$ 31.47	\$ -	\$ 108.25	
SITE ADDRESS: 422 OBERMAN PL		2016	\$ 65.40	\$ -	\$ 30.67	\$ -	\$ 96.07	
1104180002010025		2015	\$ 65.36	\$ -	\$ 43.75	\$ 237.36	\$ 346.47	
WOODCREST ADDN PT L 79; PT LOT 111 & 112; BEG 10' S & 100 W NE COR LOT 112 W 100; N 50 E 100; S 5 SEC: 18 TWP: 44 RNG: 11					TOTAL	\$	550.79	NO BID
					GRAND TOTAL	\$	198,911.92	TOTAL BID \$ 41,877.18 \$ 540.00 \$ 42,417.18 BASE BID \$ 14,479.32 OVERAGE \$ 27,397.86