

SAFETY AND SECURITY FILM FOR WINDOWS AND DOORS

Bid Opening: 11/16/18

Bid Award: 11/27/2018

	BASE BID: No Anchoring System						ALT 1: Forced Entry Mitigation System						ALT 2: Blast Mitigation System					
	Brady's Jefferson City Glass <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		Sound Performanc The Tint Guys <i>Columbia, MO</i>		USWA Film, LLC <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		Brady's Jefferson City Glass <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		SoundPerformanc The Tint Guys <i>Columbia, MO</i>		USWA Film, LLC <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		Brady's Jefferson City Glass <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>		SoundPerformanc The Tint Guys <i>Columbia, MO</i>		USWA Film, LLC <i>Jefferson City, MO</i>	
	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended	Cost Each	Extended
JAIL	\$1,738.00		\$1,496.40		\$798.18		NO BID		\$2,131.24		NO BID		NO BID		\$2,368.44		NO BID	
12 Jail plumbing chase windows on west and south sides	\$132.00	\$1,584.00	\$103.20	\$1,238.40	\$59.82	\$717.84	NO BID	NO BID	\$152.27	\$1,827.24	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$169.87	\$2,038.44	NO BID	NO BID
1 Jail clerk window	\$154.00	\$154.00	\$258.00	\$258.00	\$80.34	\$80.34	NO BID	NO BID	\$304.00	\$304.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$330.00	\$330.00	NO BID	NO BID
HIGH AND ADAMS STREETS	\$3,366.00		\$3,118.92		\$1,732.78		NO BID		\$3,953.08		NO BID		NO BID		\$4,569.60		NO BID	
3 High Street conference room- two (2) panes of glass per window	\$198.00	\$594.00	\$183.47	\$550.41	\$100.38	\$301.14	NO BID	NO BID	\$232.53	\$697.59	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$268.80	\$806.40	NO BID	NO BID
5 Remainder of High Street- four (4) panes of glass per window	\$396.00	\$1,980.00	\$366.93	\$1,834.65	\$204.52	\$1,022.60	NO BID	NO BID	\$465.07	\$2,325.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$537.60	\$2,688.00	NO BID	NO BID
2 Adams Street- four (4) panes of glass per window	\$396.00	\$792.00	\$366.93	\$733.86	\$204.52	\$409.04	NO BID	NO BID	\$465.07	\$930.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$537.60	\$1,075.20	NO BID	NO BID
FRONT PARKING AREA OFF HIGH STREET	NO BID		\$2,935.44		\$1,606.08		\$4,268.00		\$4,650.70		\$569.84		NO BID		\$5,376.00		\$626.10	
2 Reception area- four (4) panes of glass per window (with anchoring system)							\$550.00	\$1,100.00	\$465.07	\$930.14	\$284.92	\$569.84	NO BID	NO BID	\$537.60	\$1,075.20	\$313.05	\$626.10
8 Remainder of windows- four (4) panes of glass per window	NO BID	NO BID	\$366.93	\$2,935.44	\$200.76	\$1,606.08	\$396.00	\$3,168.00	\$465.07	\$3,720.56	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$537.60	\$4,300.80	NO BID	NO BID
DOORS	\$1,620.00		\$1,197.45		\$675.19		NO BID		\$1,658.02		NO BID		NO BID		\$1,731.42		NO BID	
1 Single exit door into front parking area off of High Street	\$180.00	\$180.00	\$133.05	\$133.05	\$73.09	\$73.09	NO BID	NO BID	\$184.22	\$184.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$192.38	\$192.38	NO BID	NO BID
4 Exterior double doors- patrol, main lobby, jail lobby & training room	\$360.00	\$1,440.00	\$266.10	\$1,064.40	\$150.53	\$602.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$368.45	\$1,473.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$384.76	\$1,539.04	NO BID	NO BID
BASE BID WITH FORCED ENTRY MITIGATION ON TWO (2) RECEPTION AREA WINDOWS	\$10,992.00		\$9,678.35		\$5,382.07													
BASE BID WITH BLAST MITIGATION ON TWO (2) RECEPTION AREA WINDOWS	NO BID		\$9,823.41		\$5,438.33													
FORCED ENTRY MITIGATION ALL WINDOWS & DOORS							NO BID		\$12,393.04		NO BID							
BLAST MITIGATION ALL WINDOWS & DOORS													NO BID		\$14,045.46		NO BID	

In addition to their bid response, USWA Film has offered to install 9 MIL Silver 20 instead of 8 MIL Clear film at the same cost as the 8 MIL Clear film. In addition, the offer has been made to donate the following resources to the Cole County Sheriff's Department: DOW 995 adhesive to anchor the security film to the frames of the nine doors in the bid (est cost \$352) and DOW 995 adhesive to anchor the security film on any single 10 window panes to the frames (est cost \$240).