

Bid No. 2019-07

# COLD MILLING & ASPHALT PAVING SERVICES

Cole County Department of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2/14/2019

Bid Award: 2/26/2019

|   | <b>Jefferson Asphalt</b><br><i>Jefferson City, MO</i><br>Contact: Mike Huff<br><i>(573) 636-7121</i> | <b>Higgins Asphalt</b><br><i>Tipton, MO</i><br>Contact: Micah Higgins<br><i>(660) 252-4540</i> |
|---|--|--|
| <b>ASPHALT MILLING</b>  |  |  |
| 4 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$500.00   | \$600.00   |
| 6 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$700.00   | NO BID   |
| 7 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$700.00   | NO BID   |
| <b>CONCRETE MILLING</b>   |  |  |
| 4 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$500.00   | NO BID   |
| 6 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$700.00   | NO BID   |
| 7 Foot Head (Price per Hour)  | \$700.00   | NO BID   |
| <b>Daily Mobilization Cost for Miling Machine</b>                     | \$1,850.00   | \$2,000.00   |
| <b>Skid Steer with Clean-up Broom &amp; Operator (Price per Hour)</b> | \$150.00   | \$200.00   |
| <b>ASPHALT PAVER</b>  |  |  |
| Paver (Price per Hour)  | \$400.00   | \$600.00   |
| Daily Mobilization Cost   | \$610.00   | \$900.00   |
| PERIOD FOR WHICH BID IS FIRM:   | 12 MOS.  | 12 MOS.  |
| AGREE TO COOPERATIVE PROCUREMENT?                                     | YES  | YES  |