

BID TAB 2020-09
SIGN MATERIALS
COLE COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS
BID OPENING: 2/20/2020

Item No.	Description	Vulcan Signs Foley, AL Contact: David Beviacqua (800) 633-6845	Lightle Enterprises Frankfort, OH Contact: Joan Kellenbergr (740) 998-5363	MD Solutions Plain City, OH Contact: Neil Louy (614) 873-2222
U-CHANNEL BRACKETS				
1	BRACKET-P 5 1/2" @ 90 DEGREES	\$3.95	\$2.90	\$3.50
2	BRACKET-P 5 1/2" @ 180 DEGREES	\$3.95	\$2.90	\$3.50
3	BRACKET-P 5 1/2" - CROSS	\$4.25	\$2.90	\$3.50
ADJUSTABLE 6 1/2 INCH SIGN HOLDERS				
4	6 1/2 INCH U CHANNEL CAP	\$12.50	\$14.80	\$8.50
5	6 1/2 INCH CROSS	\$12.50	\$14.80	\$8.50
ADJUSTABLE 12 INCH SIGN HOLDERS				
6	12 INCH U CHANNEL CAP	\$10.55	\$22.24	\$17.00
7	12 INCH CROSS	\$10.55	\$22.24	\$17.00
U-CHANNEL POSTS				
8	10 FEET LONG	\$35.50	\$35.80	\$32.73
9	12 FEET LONG	\$42.60	\$42.96	\$39.28
10	14 FEET LONG	\$56.80	\$50.12	\$45.82
TELESPAR POSTS				
11	10 FOOT 12 GAUGE 1 3/4 INCH	\$26.64	\$32.36	\$33.86
12	3 FOOT 12 GAUGE BASE POST 2 INCH	\$10.40	\$11.50	\$12.00
BLANKS-ALUMINUM SIGNS (UNPUNCHED)				
13	6" x 12"	\$1.82	\$1.70	NO BID
14	6" X 30"	\$4.01	\$4.13	NO BID
15	6" X 36"	\$4.88	\$4.95	NO BID
16	6" X 42"	\$5.70	\$5.78	NO BID
17	6" X 48"	\$6.35	\$6.60	NO BID
18	9" X 30"	\$5.88	\$6.19	NO BID
19	9" X 36"	\$7.20	\$7.43	NO BID
20	9" X 42"	\$8.53	\$8.66	NO BID
21	9" X 48"	\$9.46	\$9.90	NO BID
22	9" X 54"	\$10.93	\$11.14	NO BID
23	12" X 48"	\$12.49	\$13.20	NO BID
24	12" X 54"	\$14.01	\$14.85	NO BID
25	12" X 60"	\$15.55	\$16.50	NO BID
26	12" X 66"	\$17.00	\$18.15	NO BID
BLANKS-ALUMINUM SIGNS				
27	6" x 12"	\$3.33	\$3.60	NO BID
28	6" X 30"	\$8.08	\$8.38	NO BID
29	6" X 36"	\$9.72	\$10.05	NO BID
30	6" X 42"	\$14.31	\$11.73	NO BID
31	6" X 48"	\$12.49	\$13.40	NO BID
32	9" X 30"	\$12.19	\$12.56	NO BID
33	9" X 36"	\$14.52	\$15.08	NO BID
34	9" X 42"	\$16.88	\$17.54	NO BID
35	9" X 48"	\$18.63	\$20.10	NO BID
36	9" X 54"	\$20.99	\$22.61	NO BID
37	12" X 48"	\$24.84	\$26.80	NO BID
38	12" X 54"	\$27.95	\$30.15	NO BID
39	12" X 60"	\$31.05	\$33.50	NO BID
40	12" X 66"	\$34.16	\$36.85	NO BID
3M 3930 SERIES HIGH INTENSITY - PRESSURE SENSITIVE				
41	BLUE	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
42	RED	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
43	ORANGE	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
44	GREEN	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
45	WHITE	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
46	YELLOW	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
47	BROWN	\$1.25	\$1.34	\$1.35
48	BARICADE (ORANGE/WHITE), LEFT ANGLED	\$1.66	\$1.57	\$2.25
49	BARICADE (ORANGE/WHITE), RIGHT ANGLED	\$1.66	\$1.57	\$2.25
3M ACRYLIC OVERLAY (E. C.) FILM				
50	BLUE	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
51	RED	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
52	ORANGE	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
53	GREEN	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
54	YELLOW	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
55	BROWN	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
56	BLACK	\$1.05	\$1.10	\$1.15
3M 7725 SERIES NON-REFLECTIVE VINYL FILM				
57	BLUE	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
58	RED	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
59	ORANGE	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
60	GREEN	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
61	YELLOW	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
62	BROWN	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25
63	BLACK	\$1.13	\$1.11	\$1.25

		Vulcan Signs Foley, AL Contact: David Beviacqua (800) 633-6845	Lightle Enterprises Frankfort, OH Contact: Joan Kellenbergr (740) 998-5363	MD Solutions Plain City, OH Contact: Neil Louy (614) 873-2222
Item No.	Description			
REGULATORY SIGNS HIGH INTENSITY 3M				
64	R1-1 - 30" x 30" - STOP SIGN	\$26.16	\$33.80	NO BID
65	R1-1 36" x 36" - STOP SIGN	\$38.01	\$49.50	NO BID
66	R1-2 - 36" X 36" - YIELD SIGN	\$20.87	\$25.50	NO BID
67	R1-4 - 12"X6" FOUR WAY	\$2.59	\$2.80	NO BID
68	R1-4 - 12"X6" THREE WAY	\$2.59	\$2.80	NO BID
69	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 20 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
70	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 25 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
71	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 30 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
72	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 35 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
73	R2-1 -24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 40 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
74	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 45 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
75	R2-1 -24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 50 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
76	R2-1- 24" X 30" - SPEED LIMIT - 55 MPH	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
77	R3-8 36"	\$38.16	\$50.04	NO BID
78	R3-9B- 24" X 36" CENTER LANE ONLY	\$25.44	\$33.36	NO BID
79	R4-7 - 24" X 30"	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
80	R5-1- 30" X 30" DO NOT ENTER	\$26.50	\$39.75	NO BID
81	R6-1R - 36" X 12"	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
82	R7-1- 12" X 18" NO PARKING ANYTIME	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
83	R7-1- 18" X 24" NO PARKING ANYTIME	\$13.19	\$16.68	NO BID
84	R7-8 - 12" X 18" RESERVED HANDICAPPED WITH DOUBLE ARROW	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
85	R7-1D -12" X 18" NO PARKING ANYTIME WITH DOUBLE ARROW	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
86	R7-1D -12" X 18" NO PARKING BEYOND THIS POINT	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
87	R7-10 -12" X 18" - NO PARKING THIS SIDE OF STREET	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
88	R7-12 - 12" X 18" NO PARKING BETWEEN SIGNS	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
89	R7-12 - 12" X 18" NO PARKING (BLANK BOTTOM)	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
90	R7-126 - 12"X18" NO PARKING BETWEEN SIGNS W/DOUBLE ARROW	\$6.36	\$8.34	NO BID
91	R12-1 24" X 30" WEIGHT LIMIT BLANK TONS	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
92	S1-1 30" SCHOOL ADVANCE WARNING FLOURSCENT YELLOW GREEN	\$32.28	\$41.25	NO BID
93	S4-3 24" X 8" SCHOOL FLOURSCENT YELLOW GREEN	\$7.59	\$8.94	NO BID
94	W11-2 - 30" X 30"	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
95	W18-3 - 24" X 30" - DO NOT ENTER WHEN FLOODED	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
96	W18-3 - 24" X 30" - ROAD CLOSED WATER OVER ROAD	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
97	W18-3 - 12" X 18" WHITE BLANK WITH BLACK TRIM	\$5.84	\$8.34	NO BID
98	W18-3 - 18" X 24" WHITE BLANK WITH BLACK TRIM	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
99	W18-3 - 24" X 10" WHITE BLANK WITH BLACK TRIM	\$7.84	\$9.29	NO BID
100	W18-3 - 24" X 30" WHITE BLANK WITH BLACK TRIM	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
101	W18-3 - 30" X 36" WHITE BLANK WITH BLACK TRIM	\$31.80	\$41.70	NO BID
102	W18-3 - 12" X 18" WHITE BLANK WITH RED TRIM	\$5.84	\$8.34	NO BID
103	W18-3 - 18" X 24" WHITE BLANK WITH RED TRIM	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
104	W18-3 - 24" X 30" WHITE BLANK WITH RED TRIM	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
105	W18-3 - 30" X 36" WHITE BLANK WITH RED TRIM	\$31.80	\$41.70	NO BID
106	W18-3 - 30" X 24" DANGER KEEP CLEAR OF (?)	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
107	24" X 30" - NO DUMPING - VIOLATORS WILL BE PROSECUTED	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
108	24" X 30" - NO TRESPASSING	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
WARNING SIGNS HIGH INTENSITY 3M				
109	W1-1R 30" X 30" TURN SIGN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
110	W1-1L 30" X 30" TURN SIGN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
111	W1-2R 30" X 30" CURVE SIGN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
112	W1-2L 30" X 30" CURVE SIGN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
113	W1-3R 30" X 30" REVERSE TURN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
114	W1-3L 30" X 30" REVERSE TURN	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
115	W1-4R 30" X 30" REVERSE CURVE	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
116	W1-4L 30" X 30" REVERSE CURVE	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
117	W1-5R 30" X 30" WINDY ROAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
118	W1-5L 30" X 30" WINDY ROAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
119	W1-6 24" X 48" DIRECTION ARROW	\$33.92	\$44.48	NO BID
120	W1-7 24" X 48" DIRECTION DOUBLE HEAD ARROW - 24" X 48"	\$33.92	\$44.48	NO BID
121	W1-8 18" X 24" CHEVRONS	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
122	W2-1 30" X 30"	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
123	W2-2 30" X 30"	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
124	W2-4 30" X 30"	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
125	W2-5 30" X 30"	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
126	W2-6 30" X 30" ROUNDABOUT SYMBOL	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
127	W3-1A 30" X 30" STOP AHEAD - SYMBOL	\$27.41	\$38.00	NO BID
128	W3-1A 36" X 36" STOP AHEAD - SYMBOL	\$39.04	\$55.00	NO BID
129	W3-3 30" X 30" FLUORESCENT YELLOW	\$27.91	\$41.88	NO BID
130	W4-4P 24" X 12" CROSS TRAFFIC DOES NOT STOP	\$9.27	\$16.12	NO BID
131	W5-3 30" X 30" ONE LANE BRIDGE	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
132	W5-3 36" X 36" ONE LANE BRIDGE	\$38.16	\$50.04	NO BID
133	W8-3 30" X 30" PAVEMENT ENDS	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
134	W8-3P 18" X 24" PAVEMENT ENDS	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
135	W10-1 30" RAILROAD CROSSING	\$26.64	\$34.75	NO BID
136	W10-1 36" RAILROAD CROSSING	\$39.94	\$50.04	NO BID
137	W10-2 30" X 30" SIDE TRACK CROSSING SYMBOL	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
138	W11A-2 30" X 30" PEDESTRIAN CROSSING	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
139	W11-2 30" X 30" FLUORESCENT YELLOW	\$33.59	\$41.88	NO BID
140	W11-8 30" X 30" FIREHOUSE - SYMBOL	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
141	W11-8 30" X 30" FLUORESCENT YELLOW	\$33.59	\$41.88	NO BID
142	W13-1 18" X 18" 15 MPH	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
143	W13-1 18" X 18" 20 MPH	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
144	W13-1 18" X 18" 25 MPH	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID

Item No.	Description	Vulcan Signs Foley, AL Contact: David Beviacqua (800) 633-6845	Lightle Enterprises Frankfort, OH Contact: Joan Kellenbergr (740) 998-5363	MD Solutions Plain City, OH Contact: Neil Louy (614) 873-2222
145	W13-1 18" X 18" 30 MPH	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
146	W13-1 18" X 18" 35 MPH	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
147	W14-2 30" X 30" NO OUTLET	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
148	W14-8 30" X 30" FLOOD AREA AHEAD	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
149	W16-7P 24" X 12" DIAGONAL ARROW PLAQUE FLRSCNT YLW GREEN	\$11.65	\$13.40	NO BID
150	W 16-9P 24" X 12" AHEAD PLAQUE FLORESCENT YELLOW GREEN	\$11.65	\$13.40	NO BID
151	W16-7P 24" X 12" FLUORESCENT YELLOW	\$11.65	\$13.40	NO BID
152	W 16-9P 24" X 12" FLUORESCENT YELLOW	\$11.65	\$13.40	NO BID
153	W16-17P 24" X 12" ROUNDABOUT PLAQUE	\$9.27	\$11.12	NO BID
154	W18-1 30" X 30" IMPASSABLE DURING HIGH WATER	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
155	W41-1 30" X 30" YELLOW BLANK WITH BLACK BORDER	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
156	W41-1 24" X 24" YELLOW BLANK WITH BLACK BORDER	\$16.96	\$22.24	NO BID
157	W41-1 18" X 18" YELLOW BLANK WITH BLACK BORDER	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
CONSTRUCTION SIGNS HIGH INTENSITY 3M				
158	W8-1 30" X 30" BUMP	\$26.50	\$34.75	NO BID
159	W20-1 30" X 30" ROAD CLOSED	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
160	W20-3 30" X 30" ROAD CLOSED AHEAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
161	W20-4 30" X 30" ONE LANE ROAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
162	W21-4 30" X 30" ROAD WORK AHEAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
163	W21-4 30" X 30" SLOW	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
164	W21-4 30" X 30" LOW SHOULDERS	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
165	W21-4 30" X 30" UNEVEN LANE	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
166	W21-4 30" X 30" LOOSE GRAVEL/ FRESH OIL	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
167	W21-4 30" X 30" DETOUR AHEAD	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
168	W21-4 30" X 24" DETOUR ARROW TO THE RIGHT	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
169	W21-4 30" X 24" DETOUR ARROW TO THE LEFT	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
170	W21-4 30" X 24" DETOUR ARROW STRAIGHT	\$21.20	\$27.80	NO BID
171	30" X 30" ORANGE BLANK WITH BLACK BORDER	\$26.20	\$34.75	NO BID
MISCELLANEOUS SIGNS HIGH INTENSITY 3M				
172	OM-3L - 10" X 30" BLACK ON YELLOW	\$9.24	\$11.60	NO BID
173	OM-3R - 10" X 30" BLACK ON YELLOW	\$9.24	\$11.60	NO BID
174	OM-3R - 12" X 36" BLACK ON YELLOW	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
175	OM-3L - 12" X 36" BLACK ON YELLOW	\$12.72	\$16.68	NO BID
176	(RED) END OF THE ROAD DELINEATORS 18" X 18"	\$10.36	\$12.51	NO BID
Delivery		30 DAYS	30-45 DAYS	Not Stated
Bid Pricing Firm		12 MOS	12 MOS	Not Stated
Agree to Cooperative Procurement?		Not Stated	Yes	Not Stated